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AUSTRIAN HEARTBEATS AT NOUVELLE PRAGUE 2017 
 
Nouvelle Prague is the first-ever showcasing festival in the Czech Republic, held in the Staropramen
Brewery in the heart of Prague. This year the focus is on creating a regional culture/business meeting
point, and facilitating interaction between the international participants. Topcis include new sources of
income, the importance of regional markets, the social and moral responsibilities and opportunities of
major events as well as the futuere of record labels in an ever changing music landscape. Among the
first announced speakers are Fruzsina Szép (Lollapalooza Berlin), Ruud Berends (Eurosonic
Noorderslag), Christof Huber (St Gallen Open Air, Yourope), Marcin Bakiewicz (ANTY Radio Poland),
Tomek Waśko (Go Ahead) and many more.READ MORE

 

AUSTRIAN HEARTBEATS AT LINECHECK FESTIVAL
MILAN
 
Linecheck is a music festival and meeting point for industry professionals, held in the Italian city of
Milan, from 21 to 26 November 2017, for its third edition. Forming part of the wider Milano Music
Week, Linecheck presents an extensive program of talks, showcases, discussions that explore Italy’s
music industry and its relationship with the global scene, featuring international players and the major
protagonists of Italian industry, with more than 40 guest speakers. The idea behind Linecheck is
involving the Italian music industry, from the rights-holders such as artists and managers, labels,
producers, publishing and relative collecting societies, the media (magazines-radio- tv-cinema on and
offline), as well as the live music sector. First speakers include Pietro Camonchia (Metatron/INRI),
Alberto Scotti (DJ Mag Italia), Harry Follett (Manana Festival) and Stefan Reichmann (Haldern
Pop). READ MORE

 

BEST OF WAVES VIENNA 2017 

The seventh edition of Waves Vienna Music Festival & Conference is over and it proved to be a
sweeping success! 12.800 visitors including 800 from the global music industry enjoyed 100 concerts
from upcoming artists from across Europe and beyond. A total of 32 Austrian artists performed among
the amazing international line-up. Mesmerizing shows in the St. Canisius’s Church , i.e. by young
Austrian producer Wandl and Black Palms Orchestra, label nights by Seayou Records and
Futuresfuture as well as Warner Music Austria, The Gap and GLP, and numerous shows by promising
newcomers proved the consistent quality of the local music scene. READ MORE

 

APPLICATIONS FOR SXSW, MARCH 9–18, 2018

Founded in 1987 in Austin, Texas, SXSW is best known for its conference and festivals that celebrate
the convergence of the interactive, film, and music industries. The event features sessions,
showcases, screenings, exhibitions, and a variety of networking opportunities. SXSW 2018 will take
place March 9–18, 2018 in Austin, TX. Again, Advantage Austria will showcase a selection of Austria´s
most innovative and promising young artists, startups, brands and institutions from the music and
interactive scenes. In recent years, artists like James Hersey, Manu Delago or Hubert von Goisern
performed at the festival. READ MORE
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EUROSONIC 2018
NIHILS 

 

EUROPAVOX VIENNA
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TWENTY YEARS OF
SOFA SURFERS

UPCOMING CONCERTS
LOCAL ARTISTS ON
TOUR
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